The Tavistock and Portman m

NHS Foundation Trust

Freedom of Information Act 2000 disclosure log entry

Reference
21-22206

Date sent
12/01/2022

Subject

Energy Tariff and Budget 2021/22

Details of enquiry

1. Whether the Trust is on a fixed rate tariff contract for energy.

2. The Trust's annual energy budget for 2021/22.

3. Whether the Trust anticipates any additional energy costs in the second half of 2021/22.
4.

If yes to the above, the value of any estimated additional energy costs for the second half of 2021/22.

Response sent

1. Whether the Trust is on a fixed rate tariff contract for energy.
No

2. The Trust's annual energy budget for 2021/22.
We do not hold this information

3. Whether the Trust anticipates any additional energy costs in the second half of 2021/22.
We do not hold this information

4. If yes to the above, the value of any estimated additional energy costs for the second half of 2021/22.
Not applicable — see above responses.
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