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Freedom of Information Act 2000 disclosure log entry 

Reference 
18-19004 

Date sent 
24/04/2018 

Subject 
Miscellaneous AFS/CYAF Questions 

Details of enquiry 
1. Premature mortality of those with mental health conditions  

a. What is the rate of premature mortality in people with mental health problems? 

2. Out of area beds  
a. What was the total number of persons sent to out of area beds in the years specified above (2015-16, 

2016-17, 2017-18)? 

3. Early intervention in psychosis (EIP)  
a. What is the percentage of persons referred to EIP services who start treatment within two weeks? 

4. Adult mental health: Acute hospital liaison  
a. Does your trust provide A&E and Ward liaison teams? Do they operate 24/7?  

5. Crisis and acute care and suicide prevention  
a. Do you provide 24/7 crisis resolution home treatment as an alternative to acute in-patient admission?  

6. Children’s and young people’s (CYP) mental health  
a. What percentage of children and young people who are referred to a specialist mental health service with 

a first episode of psychosis start assessment within 2 weeks? 
b. What percentage CYP with suspected severe depression and at high risk of suicide are assessed by 

CAMHS (Child and Adolescent Mental Health Services) professionals within 24 hours from referral? 
c. What percentage of CYP with suspected severe depression but not at high risk of suicide are assessed by 

CAMHS professionals within 2 weeks from referral? 
d. Do you provide specialist treatment for CYP with an eating disorder? 

7. Perinatal mental health  
a. Do you provide specialist perinatal mental health services?  
b. What percentage of women referred for psychological interventions in pregnancy or the postnatal period 

start treatment within 6 weeks of referral? 

8. Mental health of older persons  
a. Do you provide tailored, community based, physical or other activity programmes for older persons? 
b. Do you ensure that older persons with multiple long-term conditions have physical and mental health 

needs included in care and support needs assessments? 
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Response Sent 
1. Premature mortality of those with mental health conditions  

a. What is the rate of premature mortality in people with mental health problems? 

We do not hold this data. We would only record whether a patient died whilst 

undergoing treatment 

2. Out of area beds  

a. What was the total number of persons sent to out of area beds in the years specified 

above (2015-16, 2016-17, 2017-18)? 

Not applicable. The Tavistock and Portman NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist mental 

health Trust which provides outpatient psychotherapy services only. The Trust has no 

inpatient services and does not provide funding for inpatient care. 

3. Early intervention in psychosis (EIP)  

a. What is the percentage of persons referred to EIP services who start treatment within 

two weeks? 

We do not hold this data. This information is recorded by Camden and Islington NHS 

Foundation Trust, to whom this query should be addressed. 

4. Adult mental health: Acute hospital liaison  

a. Does your trust provide A&E and Ward liaison teams? Do they operate 24/7?  

Not applicable. This Trust does not provide acute services. 

5. Crisis and acute care and suicide prevention  

a. Do you provide 24/7 crisis resolution home treatment as an alternative to acute in-

patient admission?  

Not applicable. This Trust does not provide acute services. 

6. Children’s and young people’s (CYP) mental health  

a. What percentage of children and young people who are referred to a specialist mental 

health service with a first episode of psychosis start assessment within 2 weeks? 

We do not hold this data. Camden and Islington record appointments for those referred 

to EIS as above. 

b. What percentage CYP with suspected severe depression and at high risk of suicide are 

assessed by CAMHS (Child and Adolescent Mental Health Services) professionals 

within 24 hours from referral? 

For the period 2015/16 to 2017/18 the primary reason for referral for 382 cases was 

stated as ‘depression/low mood’. We do not hold data electronically on the number of 

referrals who were/were not at risk of suicide at the time of referral, and to extract this 

data manually from patient records would require more resources than required by the 

FOI Act 2000. 

c. What percentage of CYP with suspected severe depression but not at high risk of 

suicide are assessed by CAMHS professionals within 2 weeks from referral? 

Our response to question 6b) above, refers 

d. Do you provide specialist treatment for CYP with an eating disorder? 
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At this Trust we do not provide dedicated treatment or diagnose eating disorders. We do 
not have a dedicated service dealing with this, though we might work with eating 
problems as part of an overall mental health presentation. 

7. Perinatal mental health  

a. Do you provide specialist perinatal mental health services?  

b. What percentage of women referred for psychological interventions in pregnancy or the 

postnatal period start treatment within 6 weeks of referral? 

We do not provide dedicated perinatal care 

8. Mental health of older persons  

a. Do you provide tailored, community based, physical or other activity programmes for 

older persons? 

We do not provide dedicated services for older persons, our services are inclusive 

b. Do you ensure that older persons with multiple long-term conditions have physical and 

mental health needs included in care and support needs assessments? 

We do not provide dedicated services for older persons, our services are inclusive. 


