Freedom of Information Act 2000 disclosure log entry

Reference

17-18210

Date sent

22/11/2017

Subject

Itemisation of Supplier Spend – Consultancy 2016-17

Details of enquiry

For the financial year 2016-17, including to date, please provide details for all consultancy services the Trust has used.

Please could you itemise each supplier and the total fees they received.

Response Sent

I confirm that we hold the data in question, but are unable to separate out some elements, requested under points 1. and 2. below, due to time and resources constraints which is explained below against the relevant points. The data requested under point 3. below is attached.

1. Details for all consultancy services the Trust has used, 2016-17 We do not hold our electronic data in a way which identifies the services provided by each of the consultancy services.

To undertake this exercise manually would require resources beyond the scope of Section 12 of the FOI Act 2000, and requires more than of 18 hours of labour so we are thereby unable to comply with this part of your request under section 12 of the FOI Act 2000.

2. Details for all consultancy services the Trust has used YTD (year to date) 2017-18 We do not hold our data in a way which electronically identifies all the consultancy services paid year to date for this financial year. This data will be available after the ledgers close at the end of the financial year.

To undertake this exercise manually would require resources beyond the scope of Section 12 the FOI Act 2000, and requires more than of 18 hours of labour so we are thereby unable to comply with this part of your request under section 12 of the FOI Act 2000.

3. Itemisation of each supplier and the total fees they received.

Consulting Services	2016-17
HOMERTON UNIVERSITY HOSPITAL NHS FOUNDATION TRUST	898,000
CITY & HACKNEY TOGETHER	449,996
CITY & HACKNEY GP CONFEDERATION CIC	443,103
HACKNEY CVS	367,734
ANNA FREUD CENTRE	302,112
EAST LONDON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST	300,678
ST JOSEPHS HOSPICE	289,624
CORAM	260,788
LONDON BOROUGH OF HACKNEY	254,507
CORAM TRADING LTD	231,219
TAVISTOCK CENTRE FOR COUPLE RELATIONSHIPS	102,300
ITS ALL ABOUT YOU LTD	90,510
RETHINK PERFORMANCE DEVELOPMENT LTD	85,635
NHS SHARED BUSINES	85,026
BUYER CONSULTING LTD	81,619
MCSPOON CONSULTING LTD	78,375
CARE QUALITY COMMISSION	78,208
NORTH EAST LONDON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST	72,379
METANOIA INSTITUTE	64,000
BEVERLEY THOMAS	38,820
UNIVERSITY OF READING	38,069
INSTITUTE OF HEALTH VISITING	34,595
MARY RYAN	33,950
ULTIMA BUSINESS SOLUTIONS LTD	31,105
SOLACE WOMENS AID	30,000
LIAISON VAT CONSULTANCY LTD	29,534
CENTRAL & NORTH WEST LONDON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST CURRIE & BROWN UK LTD	28,750
	25,442
MIND IN CAMDEN	23,504
MIND FOR WORK LTD	23,315
MEREDITH CONSULTING LTD	22,466
ANSELL & BAILEY	22,435
LIZ MCDONALD LTD	21,922
CENTRE FOR JUSTICE INNOVATION UK	20,000
HEALTHWATCH HACKNEY CIC	20,000
FRANCESCA CARDONA	19,778
EDGE TRAINING & CONSULTANCY LTD	19,572
LEARNING STUDIO	17,319
CHRIS NEWMAN	16,380
ADECCO UK LTD	15,652
CLARE HUFFINGTON	15,378
CAPALLANUER CONCLUTING	14,940
SARAH MILLER CONSULTING	14,395
RSM RISK ASSURANCE SERVICES LLP	14,093





NHS Foundation Trust

Consulting Services	2016-17
FIONA BIOLETTI	13,578
IDEAL HEALTH CONSULTANTS LTD	13,000
STRESS & TRAUMA CENTRE LTD	12,600
BUSINESS INTELLIGENCE PARTNERS LTD	12,122
CHANGE FX LTD	10,800
SOUTH LONDON AND MAUDSLEY NHS	9,683
FOUNDATION TRUST ALERE TOXICOLOGY PLC	9,112
CITY & HACKNEY MIND	9,000
GERALD EVE LLP	8,141
SIRIUS CONSULTANCY	8,035
BLOCK SOLUTIONS LTD	7,953
QUALITY ASSURANCE AGENCY	7,850
NHS SHARED BUSINES,NHS SBS SLA	7,752
DR SARAH TAHA	7,700
UNIVERSITY OF LONDON	7,579
LANCASTER UNIVERSITY	7,397
REED SPECIALIST RECRUITMENT LTD	7,255
OAKLEAF SURVEYING LTD	7,045
ROEHAMPTON UNIVERSITY	6,674
DAVID ARMSTRONG	6,659
SADEGH NASHAT	6,474
FRONTLINE CONSULTANTS LTD	6,420
DR RORY ALLOTT & ASSOCIATES	6,203
TRAINING ROOM HIRE CO LTD	6,156
COSMO HALLSTROM	6,104
PARLIAMENT HILL CONSULTANTS LTD	6,000
NATIONAL CENTRE FOR SOCIAL RESEARCH	5,713
INTERFACE LEGAL ADVISORY SERVICE	5,700
CAROLINE ELLIS & ASSOCIATES	5,500
HUGH SYMONS INFORMATION MANAGEMENT LTD	4,750
DR RACHEL MYCROFT	4,550
BARBARA PICHETA CONSULTING LTD	4,340
DNP CONSULTING LTD	4,320
DR AMANDA JONES	4,200
VEGA ZAGIER ROBERTS	4,000
CAMDEN & ISLINGTON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST	3,720
HYPE AND HOPE LTD	3,600
BRANDON CENTRE	3,521
DEBORAH ABRAHAMS	3,500
TIM DARTINGTON	3,300
EMIL JACKSON	3,264
DAVID NAYLOR CONSULTING LTD	3,150
LANDMARK HEALTH CONSULTING LTD	3,105
J W RUDDOCK & SONS LTD	3,024

Conculting Services	2016-17
Consulting Services	
PICKER INSTITUTE EUROPE MAXWELL STANLEY CONSULTING LTD	3,000
	2,975
WILLIAM HALTON	2,840
STUDIO VENUE CO LTD (THE)	2,808
UNIVERSITY OF WARWICK	2,700
DR CN MAYER	2,592
AMBERWING LTD	2,569
ROYAL COLLEGE OF PSYCHIATRISTS	2,526
UNIVERSITY OF EAST LONDON	2,476
WT PARTNERSHIP	2,460
DR GA HARMON	2,450
UNIVERSITEIT UTRECHT	2,127
SANCTUARY PERSONNEL LTD	2,089
AIMES MANAGEMENT SERVICES LTD	1,920
FOURSYS LTD	1,900
LOUISE RICHARDS	1,850
DAVID KING ASSOCIATES	1,842
DR L RANGEL	1,680
STEPHANY UNGLESS	1,665
JEREMY SPRIGGS	1,631
BRIDGE NETWORKS LTD	1,617
ROYAL FREE LONDON NHS FOUNDATION TRUST	1,568
C ROSEBERT	1,540
SKILLS FOR CARE LTD	1,440
MAXINE DENNIS	1,250
CLARE KISSANE	1,212
CARETOWER LTD	1,200
HAYLES & QUIN LTD	1,200
KNOWLEDGE ACADEMY LTD (THE)	1,187
JILL BAINTON	1,130
CITIZEN ADVICE MEDWAY	1,114
BRIGID MACCARTHY	1,100
LONDON BOROUGH OF TOWER HAMLETS	1,080
YEAR ONE CONSULTING LTD	1,020
CAROL BURTT	1,000
JUDY LINDSEY-CLARK	1,000
BEN WATSON	952
ERIK DE HAAN	950
ROBERT FRENCH	862
HADDY DAVIS	825
DR ROBYN VESEY	810
LONDON BOROUGH OF HARINGEY	796
TERRY LEIGH	775
COASTAL COUNSELLING	770



Consulting Services	2016-17
NICOLA CHADD	754
EVARIST CLIFFE & CO	720
BRITISH PSYCHOANALYTIC COUNCIL	700
MILOS TADIC	700
PERVASIVE NETWORKS LTD	637
MIRANDA ALCOCK	620
TALKCHANGE LTD	600
LONDON BOROUGH OF ENFIELD	590
FREUD MUSEUM	550
INTERNAL SYSTEMS LTD	520
ACTIVE SECURITY GROUP LTD	516
LONDON BOROUGH OF HAVERING	495
WHITECOT CONSULTANCY LTD	475
LONDON BOROUGH OF BARKING & DAGENHAM	454
SWISS COTTAGE SCHOOL DRC	420
BERNIE BROOKS CONSULTING LTD	414
ONE STOP ALTERNATIVES LTD	348
FRC PREPARERS LEVY	261
E-REWARD.CO.UK LTD	234
WARWICK UNIVERSITY SERVICES LTD	225
DR AMRA RAO	200
HOSPITAL ROOM	200
PRO ACTORS	200
INDEPENDENT ASSOCIATION OF PRE SCHOOL	181
CAPITA TRAVEL & EVENTS	181
WSM HALTON	180
JONATHAN RABSON FAMILY & COUPLES SYSTEM PSYCHOTHERAPIST	150
VISION REDBRIDGE CULTURE & LEISURE	150
HOPE SAMUEL	100
JUDITH FELMAN	100
MICKEY & MALLORY LTD	100
WORD SOURCE LTD	91
KINGS COLLEGE LONDON	78
ALAN COLAM	66
LONDON BOROUGH OF CAMDEN	55
KENNETH TOUGH	28
Total	5,502,567