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Nurses Absence Through Sickness, Stress

Details of enquiry
Could | please have the following for the year 2011/12 to 2016/17, broken down by financial year.

The number of nurses who took one or more days off work due to stress or anxiety
The total number of days taken off sick with stress or anxiety by nurses

Total number of nurses employed

The number of nurses who have left the service due to stress or anxiety since 2011
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Response Sent

1. The number of nurses who took one or more days off work due to stress or anxiety
We do not hold this data. The Trust does not record reasons for absence on its electronic
HR / payroll solution nor its manual absence returns.

2. The total number of days taken off sick with stress or anxiety by nurses
We do not hold this data. The Trust does not record reasons for absence on its electronic
HR / payroll solution nor its manual absence returns.

3. Total number of nurses employed
This information is exempt under Section 21 of the Freedom of Information Act (FOIA)
2000, because it is accessible to you, in the public domain, and can be obtained from NHS
Digital’s workforce statistics data collection via the following link:
http://content.digital.nhs.uk/searchcatalogue?topics=1%2fWorkforce%2fStaff+numbers&sort=Relevance&s
ize=10&page=1#top

4. The number of nurses who have left the service due to stress or anxiety since 2011.
We do not hold this data. The Trust’'s HR/payroll solution does not provide a category for
leaving due to stress and anxiety.
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