
 
 
 

Freedom of Information Act 2000 disclosure log entry 

Reference 
17-18152 

Date sent 
18/09/2017 

Subject 
Contracts Data and Services No Longer Provided 

Details of enquiry 
1. With regards to 1997 – 2010: does your trust no longer provide some services which it previously 

provided, after these services were put out to tender by the CCG and when your trust submitted a bid for 

the contracts associated with these services and lost the bid to private companies? 

2. If your trust did lose, contracts or parts of its operations running to private companies from 1997 – 2010, 

what did you lose?  

3. With regards to 2010 to present day: does your trust no longer provide some services which it previously 

provided, after these services were put out to tender by the CCG and when your trust submitted a bid for 

the contracts associated with these services and lost the bid to private companies? 

4. If your trust did lose any contracts or parts its operational running to private companies from 2010 – 

present day what did you lose? 

5. What services did you outsource to private companies from 1997 – 2010? 

6. What services did you outsource to private companies from 2010 – present day? 

7. Has your trust created its own private subsidiary company to take over the running of parts of your trust?  

8. Does your trust plan to created its own private subsidiary company to take over the running of parts of your 

trust?  

 

Response Sent 
1. With regards to 1997 – 2010: does your trust no longer provide some services which it 

previously provided, after these services were put out to tender by the CCG and when 
your trust submitted a bid for the contracts associated with these services and lost the 
bid to private companies? 

We have not lost any services through tenders put out by a CCG/PCT, but there are 

other services that we no longer provide, for various reasons. 

2. If your trust did lose, contracts or parts of its operations running to private companies 
from 1997 – 2010, what did you lose?  
We do not hold data in this way, and do not record the details of who wins any bids we 

may lose. 

3. With regards to 2010 to present day: does your trust no longer provide some services 
which it previously provided, after these services were put out to tender by the CCG 
and when your trust submitted a bid for the contracts associated with these services 
and lost the bid to private companies? 



 
 
 

We do not hold data in this way, and do not record the details of who wins any bids we 

may lose. 

4. If your trust did lose any contracts or parts its operational running to private companies 
from 2010 – present day what did you lose? 
We do not hold data in this way. 

5. What services did you outsource to private companies from 1997 – 2010? 
We do not keep contractual information that is more than 7 years old. 

6. What services did you outsource to private companies from 2010 – present day? 
We do not outsource whole services 

7. Has your trust created its own private subsidiary company to take over the running of 
parts of your trust?  
No 

8. Does your trust plan to created its own private subsidiary company to take over the 
running of parts of your trust? 

No.  Not at this time 
 


