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Freedom of Information Act 2000 disclosure log entry 

Reference 
23-24224 

Date response sent 
01/09/23 

Subject 
Sexual Safety Incidents 2019-YTD 

Details of enquiry 
1. The number of sexual safety incidents reported on in-patient wards from 2019 to the latest available 

month in 2023? – in each case can you specify who was affected (e.g. staff, patient etc.) and who the 
perpetrator was (e.g. staff, patient etc.) and specify the sex of the parties involved. Could you split the 
data month and year please (e.g. January 2023, February 2023 etc.) 

2. How many formal sexual safety complaints have been made on in-patient wards from 2019 to the 
latest available month in 2023? – in each case can you specify the complainant (e.g. staff or patient 
etc.) and who the complaint was made against (e.g. staff or patient etc.) and specify the sex of the 
parties involved. Could you split the data month and year please (e.g. January 2023, February 2023 
etc.) 

3. How many breaches of the single sex ward policy have been recorded (patients being placed on 
mixed wards) from 2019 to the latest available month in 2023? – if possible, in each case can you 
specify the sex of the patient(s) affected. Could you split the data month and year please (e.g. 
January 2023, February 2023 etc.) 

4. How many sexual safety incidents reported across the whole Trust services from 2019 to the latest 
available month in 2023? - In each case can you specify who made the report (e.g. staff or patient 
etc.) and who was reported (e.g. staff or patient etc.) and specify the sex of the parties involved. 
Could you split the data month and year please (e.g. January 2023, February 2023 etc.) 

5. How many reports have been made to the police in relation to sexual safety incidents from 2019 to 
the latest available month in 2023? - Could you split the data month and year please (e.g. January 
2023, February 2023 etc.) 

6. Do you have an individual Board lead for sexual safety? - Please answer yes or no. 
7. Have you audited the collaborative ‘Sexual Safety Standards’ (2020) in your Trust? - Please answer 

yes or no. If yes, could you provide a copy of the report please. 

Response sent 
1. The number of sexual safety incidents reported on in-patient wards from 2019 to the latest available 

month in 2023? – in each case can you specify who was affected (e.g. staff, patient etc.) and who the 
perpetrator was (e.g. staff, patient etc.) and specify the sex of the parties involved. Could you split the 
data month and year please (e.g. January 2023, February 2023 etc.) 

Zero 

2. How many formal sexual safety complaints have been made on in-patient wards from 2019 to the 
latest available month in 2023? – in each case can you specify the complainant (e.g. staff or patient 
etc.) and who the complaint was made against (e.g. staff or patient etc.) and specify the sex of the 
parties involved. Could you split the data month and year please (e.g. January 2023, February 2023 
etc.) 

Zero 
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3. How many breaches of the single sex ward policy have been recorded (patients being placed on 
mixed wards) from 2019 to the latest available month in 2023? – if possible, in each case can you 
specify the sex of the patient(s) affected 

Not applicable.  We do not provide inpatient services. 

4. How many breaches of the single sex ward policy have been recorded (patients being placed on 
mixed wards) from 2019 to the latest available month in 2023? – if possible, in each case can you 
specify the sex of the patient(s) affected. Could you split the data month and year please (e.g. 
January 2023, February 2023 etc.) 

Zero 

5. How many sexual safety incidents reported across the whole Trust services from 2019 to the latest 
available month in 2023? - In each case can you specify who made the report (e.g. staff or patient 
etc.) and who was reported (e.g. staff or patient etc.) and specify the sex of the parties involved. 
Could you split the data month and year please (e.g. January 2023, February 2023 etc.) 

Zero 

6. How many reports have been made to the police in relation to sexual safety incidents from 2019 to 
the latest available month in 2023? - Could you split the data month and year please (e.g. January 
2023, February 2023 etc.) 

Zero 

2. Do you have an individual Board lead for sexual safety? - Please answer yes or no. 

Yes 

7. Have you audited the collaborative ‘Sexual Safety Standards’ (2020) in your Trust?  

No 


