NHS

The Tavistock and Portman
NHS Foundation Trust

Freedom of Information Act 2000 disclosure log entry

Reference
22-23298

Date response sent
24/01/23

Subject

Services Outsourced to Third Parties,

Details of enquiry

1) Please advise if the following services are outsourced to third parties. If outsourced, please provide the
scope of services outsourced, the name of organisation outsourced to and the contract end date.
a. Finance and Accounting Services (e.g. accounts payable & receivable)
b. Payroll
c. Procurement

2) Please advise what software platforms you use for:

a. Finance ERP, (e.g. Agresso)
Requisitioning System (If Finance ERP not used)
Catalogue Management System (eg GHX Nexus)
Inventory Management System ) (eg DC Gold)
Tendering Management System (eg Atamis)
Contract Management System (eg Atamis)
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Response sent

Outsourced or | Scope of services |[Name of organisation [Contract end date
in-house? outsourced to

Finance and Outsourced All Bought Ledger [NHS Shared Data not held, as
Accounting Activity Business Services  [this was set up by
Services (e.g. SBS) NHS Digital
accounts payable
& receivable)
Payroll Outsourced All Payroll Activity [Equiniti ICS Ltd Aug 2025
Procurement Outsourced All Procurement  [Elon Group Ltd June 2023

Activity

| Name of software platform Version
Finance and Accounting
Finance ERP Oracle Data not held
(e.g. Agresso)
Procurement
Requisitioning System Oracle Data not held
(if Finance ERP not used)
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Catalogue Management System

NHS Shared Business Services Dec 2023
(e.g. GHX Nexus)
Inventory Management System None N/A
(e.g. eDC Gold)
Tendering/Sourcing System Atamis Ltd Unknown
(e.g. Atamis)
Confract Management System Atamis Ltd Unknown?

(e.g. Atamis)
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