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Subject
Adults with BDD, Anorexia, Schizophrenia, OCD

Details of enquiry

1) The number of adults seen in secondary care with a diagnosis of body dysmorphic disorder (BDD) in
the last five years

2) The number of adults seen in secondary care with a diagnosis of anorexia nervosa in the last five
years

3) The number of adults seen in secondary care with a diagnosis of schizophrenia in the last five years

4) The number of adults seen in secondary care with a diagnosis of OCD in the last five years

5) The number of adults seen in primary care with a diagnosis of body dysmorphic disorder (BDD) in the
last five years

6) The number of adults seen in primary care with a diagnosis of anorexia nervosa in the last five years

7) The number of adults seen in primary care with a diagnosis of schizophrenia in the last five years

8) The number of adults seen in primary care with a diagnosis of OCD in the last five years

Response sent

The Tavistock and Portman NHS Foundation Trust’s Adults’ Psychotherapy
Service does not make formal diagnoses of BDD, Anorexia nervosa,
Schizophrenia, OCD or Body Dysmorphia, though we would work with these
conditions as part of an overall mental health presentation.

Where such diagnoses have been made by a patient’s previous clinician, prior to
referral, they would have been uploaded into the freetext sections of the patients’
records, where we would not be able to run any automated reports, and would need to
manually extract, collate, and present this data.

We hope you will understand to search for the conditions specified would require a
manual search of thousands of files, covering all patients seen over the last 5 years,
and this exceed the appropriate limit of resources provisioned under Section 12 of the
Freedom of Information Act (FOIA), for which the appropriate limit is £450, which
equates to 18 hours’ of officer time at a generic £25 per hour. We estimate that at 15
minutes per record, the time required would be 250 hours per thousand files.

It is with regret therefore that we must advise that we are engaging section 12
exemption, as we cannot process your request due to the excessive resources it would
require. We have notated your questions below as such.
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Secondary Care Services

1)

2)

3)

4)

5)

The number of adults seen in secondary care with a diagnosis of body dysmorphic disorder (BDD) in
the last five years

We do not hold our data in this way. Exemption under Section 12 of FOIA is
engaged.

The number of adults seen in secondary care with a diagnosis of anorexia nervosa in the last five
years

We do not hold our data in this way. Exemption under Section 12 of FOIA is
engaged.

The number of adults seen in secondary care with a diagnosis of schizophrenia in the last five years
We do not hold our data in this way. Exemption under Section 12 of FOIA is
engaged.

The number of adults seen in secondary care with a diagnosis of OCD in the last five years

We do not hold our data in this way. Exemption under Section 12 of FOIA is
engaged.

The number of adults seen in primary care with a diagnosis of body dysmorphic disorder (BDD) in the
last five years

We do not hold our data in this way. Exemption under Section 12 of FOIA is
engaged.

Primary Care Services:

The Tavistock and Portman NHS Foundation Trust is not a hospital and offers primary
care in Hackney only, via a Primary Care Psychotherapy Consultation Service.

The remainder of the Trust’s services are in secondary care, where we provide
specialist mental health and mainly psychological, services, as outlined above. We do
not provide any acute services or inpatient patient care and do not have an A&E
department nor provide walk-in appointments

6)

7)

8)

The number of adults seen in primary care with a diagnosis of anorexia nervosa in the last five years
We do not hold our data in this way. Exemption under Section 12 of FOIA is
engaged.

The number of adults seen in primary care with a diagnosis of schizophrenia in the last five years
We do not hold our data in this way. Exemption under Section 12 of FOIA is
engaged.

The number of adults seen in primary care with a diagnosis of OCD in the last five years
We do not hold our data in this way. Exemption under Section 12 of FOIA is
engaged.
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