The Tavistock and Portman m

NHS Foundation Trust

Freedom of Information Act 2000 disclosure log entry

Reference
22-23133

Date sent
23/08/22

Subject

Mobile Phone Contracts and Usage

Detalls of enquiry

What is the name of your organisation?

How many employees are at your organisation?

How many mobile phone and mobile broadband (data only) connections do you currently have in total?
How many of these are data only (for laptops and tablets)?

How many of these are voice and data (for mobile phones)?

Who is your mobile phone network provider?

Do you have a shared data bundle or individual allowances?

What is your organisations average total data usage across all connections?

9. What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in April 20217

10. What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in May 20217

11. What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in June 20217

12. What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in July 2021?

13. What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in August 20217

14. What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in September 20217
15. What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in October 2021?
16. What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in November 20217
17. What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in December 20217
18. What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in January 2022?
19. What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in February 2022?
20. What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in March 20227

21. Do these numbers include VAT?

22. When did you renew your mobile phone contract?

23. How long does your contract run for?

24. What is the renewal date of your contract?

25. What is the value of your hardware/technology/transformation fund provided with the contract (if none
provided please mark as n/a)

26.Who is the shareholder/primary contact for this contract?
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Response sent

1. What is the name of your organisation?
Tavistock and Portman NHS Foundation Trust

2. How many employees are at your organisation?
This information is publicly available at : https://digital.nhs.uk/data-and-
information/publications/statistical/nhs-workforce-statistics
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How many mobile phone and mobile broadband (data only) connections do you currently have in total?
535

How many of these are data only (for laptops and tablets)?
136

How many of these are voice and data (for mobile phones)?
376

Who is your mobile phone network provider?
02 and EE

Do you have a shared data bundle or individual allowances?
Individual Allowances

What is your organisations average total data usage across all connections?
We do not hold this data

What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in April 2021?
£6,381.04

What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in May 20217
£6,626.16

What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in June 2021?
£,6538.86

What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in July 2021?
£6,434.23

What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in August 20217
£6,547.49

What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in September 20217
£6,481.81

What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in October 20217
£642.48

What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in November 20217
£2,773.18

What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in December 20217
£3,115.68

What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in January 20227
£2,999.93

What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in February 20227
£2,808.30

What was your total spend on mobile phone contract and overage costs in March 2022?
£2,869.79

Do these numbers include VAT?
No

When did you renew your mobile phone contract?
02: 1st August 2021

EE: Rolling annual contract. We do not hold the start date.

How long does your contract run for?
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O2: Until August 2024
EE: Rolling annual contract

24. What is the renewal date of your contract?
02: 21st August 2022

EE: Rolling contract until further notice. No end date.

25. What is the value of your hardware/technology/transformation fund provided with the contract (if none
provided please mark as n/a)

N/A

26. Who is the shareholder/primary contact for this contract?
The procurement manager procurement@tavi-port.nhs.uk
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