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Freedom of Information Act 2000 disclosure log entry 

Reference 
22-23034 

Date sent 
22/07/22 

Subject 
Internal/External Training Fees 

Details of enquiry 
1. Amount spent each year on the internal and external training of staff members across 

all levels of seniority during the period 2018-19 and 2021-22 
2. Number of staff members trained each year during the period 2018-19 and 2021-22 

Response sent 
1. Amount spent each year on the internal and external training of staff members across 

all levels of seniority during the period 2018-19 and 2021-22 

2018-19: We do not hold any external training spend data for 2018-19. 
The Trust does not track internal training costs, so we hold no data on this. 

2021-22: £61,000 spent on External Training Courses for Staff 
The Trust does not track internal training costs, so we hold no data on this 

 

2. Number of staff members trained each year during the period 2018-19 and 2021-22 
2018-19: We do not hold any external training data for 2018-19. 

The Trust does not track internal training, so we hold no data on numbers 
of staff trained during that year.. 

2021-22: 75 members of staff attended External Training Courses in that year. 


