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Freedom of Information Act 2000 disclosure log entry 

Reference 
21-22111 

Date sent 
30/09/21 

Subject 
Referrals to CAMHS 2019-21                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                                 
Details of enquiry 
 
This is a Freedom of Information Request for NHS Trusts which run CAMH Services. If your 
Trust does not operate the CAMHS in your area, please can you let me know which local Trust 
I should be sending this FOI to.  
 

If you only run one of Core CAMH or CAMH ED services, please just answer the questions 
that relate to the services you run. Similarly, If you do not hold data for Qs 4 - 6, then please 
just supply answers to Qs 1 - 3. 
 

Questions:  
 
1. Please can you tell me the number of children and young people who had been referred to 
your Core CAMH Services for treatment on or by 31 January 2019 who were still waiting to 
start treatment with you Core CAMH Services on 31 January 2019? 

 
2. Please can you tell me the number of children and young people who had been referred to 
your CAMH Eating Disorder Services for treatment on or by 31 January 2019 who were still 
waiting to start treatment with your CAMH Eating Disorder Services on 31 January 2019? 
 

3. Please answer Question 1 and Question 2 again, but replacing all references to the date 
“31 January 2019” with the following dates:  
 

28 February 2019 
31 March 2019 
30 April 2019 
31 May 2019 
30 June 2019 
31 July 2019 
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31 August 2019 
30 September 2019 
31 October 2019 
30 November 2019 
31 December 2019 
31 January 2020 
29 February 2020 
31 March 2020 
30 April 2020 
31 May 2020 
30 June 2020 
31 July 2020 
31 August 2020 
30 September 2020 
31 October 2020 
30 November 2020 
31 December 2020 
31 January 2021 
28 February 2021 
31 March 2021 
30 April 2021 
31 May 2021 
30 June 2021 
 
4. If you hold this data, please can you tell me the number of children and young people who 
were referred from an Accident & Emergency department to your CAMH Services (including 
CAMH Eating Disorder Services, if relevant) for treatment by CAMH Services in the month of 
January 2019? 
 

5. Please can you tell me the number of children and young people known to your Core CAMH 
(and CAMH Eating Disorder services, if relevant) who were admitted to an Acute Hospital 
Trust under the Mental Health Act in the month of January 2019?  
 

6. Please answer Question 4 and Question 5 again, but replacing all references to the month 
“January 2019” the following 29 months, meaning you will again be providing data for a further 
29 months: 
 

February 2019 
March 2019 
April 2019 
May 2019 
June 2019 
July 2019 
August 2019 
September 2019 
 



 
 
 

Page 3 of 4 

October 2019 
November 2019 
December 2019 
January 2020 
February 2020 
March 2020 
April 2020 
May 2020 
June 2020 
July 2020 
August 2020 
September 2020 
October 2020 
November 2020 
December 2020 
January 2021 
February 2021 
March 2021 
April 2021 
May 2021 
June 2021 
 
 

Response sent 
 
Thank you for your request for information below, which has been handled under the Freedom 
of Information Act. 
 
Please find below the data for Items 1 and 3 of your request. 
 

31-Jan-19 278 
28-Feb-19 309 
31-Mar-19 304 
30-Apr-19 312 

31-May-19 304 
30-Jun-19 313 
31-Jul-19 261 

31-Aug-19 271 
30-Sep-19 288 
31-Oct-19 272 
30-Nov-19 297 
31-Dec-19 287 
31-Jan-20 281 
29-Feb-20 297 
31-Mar-20 249 
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30-Apr-20 143 
31-May-20 150 
30-Jun-20 153 
31-Jul-20 161 

31-Aug-20 163 
30-Sep-20 214 
31-Oct-20 247 
30-Nov-20 239 
31-Dec-20 237 
31-Jan-21 210 
28-Feb-21 189 
31-Mar-21 244 
30-Apr-21 242 

31-May-21 332 
30-Jun-21 286 

 
 
Re Question 2, we do not have an eating disorder service and did not have an eating disorder 
service at that time period 
 
Re Question 4, we do not receive direct referrals from A&E unless patients are already seen 
by us. 
 
We do not hold the data for Question 5 and Question 6 is therefore not applicable to us. 
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