
 
 
 

 

Freedom of Information Act 2000 disclosure log entry 

Reference 
17-18001 

Date sent 
01/04/2017 

Subject 
Thefts of NHS Equipment and Drugs 

Details of enquiry 
1. What NHS equipment was stolen from your trust during each of the following financial years? 

 

2014/15 

2015/16 

2016/17 

 

2. Please provide a breakdown for each year separately providing the following details: 

* the type of equipment  

* the value, estimated or otherwise, of the equipment 

* if possible, a description of the circumstances of the theft 

* any disciplinary action against any members of truth staff as a result of the theft 

 

 

3. What NHS drugs/medication was stolen from your trust during each of the following financial years? 

 

2014/15 

2015/16 



 
 
 

2016/17 

 

4. Please provide a breakdown for each year separately providing the following details: 

* the type and (if possible) quantity drug/medication  

* the value, estimated or otherwise, of the drug/medication 

* if possible, a description of the circumstances of the theft 

* any disciplinary action against any members of truth staff as a result of the theft 

 

Response Sent 
The Tavistock and Portman NHS Foundation Trust is a specialist mental health Trust which provides outpatient 

psychotherapy services only.   The Trust has no in-patient facilities or pharmacy and does not provide Acute Services. 

 

1. During the period 2014-17 this Trust has incurred the occasional theft of laptops.  No other equipment or medication 
has been stolen.  We do not hold an itemised listing of the make/model of the stolen items. 

 

2. See our response to 1. Above.  We do not hold a breakdown of the value, or the model details of the stolen laptops.   
 

3. Not applicable.  The Trust does not provide dispensing services and does not hold medication on site. 
 

4. Not applicable.  See our response to 3 above. 

 


