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Environmental Information Regulations 2004 

Disclosure log entry 

Reference 
EIR: 22-23315 

Date sent 
25/01/23 

Subject 
EIR 5G Masts at Tavi Centre 

Details of enquiry 
1. How many 5G masts do you have on your site? 

2. What date were they turned on? 

3. How much radiation do they emit over a week?  Could you please share the emissions data for any 7 day 

period in December 2022? 

4. Who is responsible for the decision to have 5G masts on the roof?  We are not asking for personal data, we 

would like to know the title of the person or the name of the body (a committee, a governing body?) that 

decided to put them on your roof. 

5. Have you had an increase in sick absence of your staff between the date the masts were turned on and 31 

December 2022? We are not asking for information that would identify any individuals. 

6. How much money is the Tavi or the NHS paid to host the masts?  Who pays that money to whom (who are 

the contracting parties)? 

7. Could you please send us a copy of the contract? 

Response sent 
Could you please process this under both regimes, the EIRs and the FOI Act.  (We noticed what might be a small 

mistake on your access to information page.  The acronym EIR stands for ‘environmental information regulations’ 

not ‘impact’ although information about impact captures the spirit of the legislation). 
 

1. How many 5G masts do you have on your site? 

We have one airwaves mast, details held do not reference 5G services for this mast and 

installation of this mast pre-dates 5G. 

2. What date were they turned on? 

We do not hold this data, but can confirm they have been in situ/on site for many years. 

3. How much radiation do they emit over a week?  Could you please share the emissions data for any 7 day 

period in December 2022? 

We do not hold this data. 

4. Who is responsible for the decision to have 5G masts on the roof?  We are not asking for personal data, we 

would like to know the title of the person or the name of the body (a committee, a governing body?) that 

decided to put them on your roof. 
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Please note that there is no suggestion that this is a 5G mast. 

The mast’s location was decided by the emergency services systems provider - Airwaves 

Solutions Ltd, part of Motorola  Solutions.   

5. Have you had an increase in sick absence of your staff between the date the masts were turned on and 31 

December 2022? We are not asking for information that would identify any individuals. 

We do not hold this information. 

6. How much money is the Tavi or the NHS paid to host the masts?  Who pays that money to whom (who are 

the contracting parties)? 

Airwaves Solutions Ltd, part of Motorola Solutions UK Managed Services pay to the Trust 

an annual rental of £16,691.58 incl VAT. 

7. Could you please send us a copy of the contract? 

Any contract of this nature is commercially sensitive but the Trust can confirm this is solely 

a rental agreement for roof space, providing permission to Airwaves Solutions Ltd to mount 

the mast on our roof. 


