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Freedom of Information Act 2000 disclosure log entry 

Reference 
17-18349 

Date sent 
23/03/2018 

Subject 
Equalities Data 

Details of enquiry 
1) What Equality and Diversity training does Tavistock and Portman NHS Foundation Trust provide to its 

healthcare professionals staff?  

2) What refresher training if any do healthcare staff receive in regards to Equality and Diversity?  
a) Does this include an elements relating to LGBT issues and LGBT patients?  

3) I wish to request information relating to the number of complaints made to the Trust relating to LGBT 
patients and healthcare professionals. 
I would like information on the number of complaints relating to: 
a) Allegations of discrimination on the grounds of LGBT status.  

i. Patients made about practitioners  
ii. Staff made against colleagues both medical and non medical.  

b) Allegations of wrongful treatment on the grounds of LGBT status. Complaints made by patients or 
their friends or family. Treatment received from any healthcare practitioner. 

c) Complaints made by LGBT patients in regards to the provision of care. 
d) Complaints made by LGBT healthcare professionals on the grounds that they have been 

discriminated or suffered bullying by colleagues because of their LGBT status. 

4) I would also like the outcomes of these complaints in regards to: 
a) closed with no further action 
b) disciplinary action taken against the healthcare professional involved and what action was taken. 

5) I would like to know the details of whether the healthcare professional complained about qualified either 
in the UK or abroad? 

6) I would like to number of complaints in the last 18 months.  

Response Sent 
1) What Equality and Diversity training does Tavistock and Portman NHS Foundation Trust provide to its 

healthcare professionals staff?  

The Trust provides equality and diversity training for all staff at induction and this is 
refreshed every three years. 

In addition to the above the Trust is currently running a cultural intelligence seminar for 
middle tier managers and a series of Thinking Spaces about race diversity. 

2) What refresher training if any do healthcare staff receive in regards to Equality and Diversity?  

Mandatory equality and diversity training is refreshed every three years. 

a) Does this include an elements relating to LGBT issues and LGBT patients?  
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The content covers a full range of information across all protected characteristics 
included ‘sexual orientation’ and is aligned to the Skills for Health Core 
Standards Framework. 

3) I wish to request information relating to the number of complaints made to the Trust relating to LGBT patients 
and healthcare professionals. 
I would like information on the number of complaints relating to: 

a) Allegations of discrimination on the grounds of LGBT status.  
i. Patients made about practitioners  

None 

ii. Staff made against colleagues both medical and non medical. 

One 

b) Allegations of wrongful treatment on the grounds of LGBT status. Complaints made by patients or their 
friends or family. Treatment received from any healthcare practitioner. 

None 

c) Complaints made by LGBT patients in regards to the provision of care. 

Since October 2016 111 complaints have been received from LGTB patients of 
the Gender Identity Clinic.  

We do not hold data relating to a complainant’s LGBT status and are therefore 
unable to identify whether any other complainants identify as LGBT. 

d) Complaints made by LGBT healthcare professionals on the grounds that they have been discriminated 
or suffered bullying by colleagues because of their LGBT status. 

One 

4) I would also like the outcomes of these complaints in regards to: 
a) closed with no further action 

We do not hold data relating to a complainant’s LGBT status and are therefore 
unable to identify whether any other complainants identify as LGBT. 

b) disciplinary action taken against the healthcare professional involved and what action was taken. 

We do not hold data relating to a complainant’s LGBT status and are therefore 
unable to identify whether any other complainants identify as LGBT. 

5) I would like to know the details of whether the healthcare professional complained about qualified either in the 
UK or abroad? 

We do not hold this information 

 


